NEW MEXICO HIGHLANDS UNIVERSITY
INVITATION FOR BID NUMBER: 881
DATE: DECEMBER 21, 2009

TITLE: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

NEW MEXICO HIGHLAMNDS UNIVERSITY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
903 UNIVERSITY AVE.
LAS VEGAS, NEW MEXICO 87701

INVITATION FOR BID NUMBER 881 AWARD

BETWEEN:
NEW MEXICO HIGHLANDS UNIVERSITY
AND
AWARDED VENDORS

TERM:

December 21, 2009 thru December 20, 2010

With the option to renew for up to two (2) additional years upon, mutual agreement. Renewals are to be made
in one (1) year increments.

AWARDED VENDORS:

(A)

Summit Electric Supply
2900 Stanford N.E.
Albuquerque, NM 87107

(B)

Voss Electric

4615 McLeod NE
Albuquerque, NM 87109

SHIP TO:

Delivery: up to 7 days following issuance of purchase order

F.OB.: Destination et HEE S f e e o




NEW MEXICO HIGHLLANDS UNIVERSITY
INVITATION FOR BID NUMBER: 881
DATE: DECEMBER 21, 2009

TITLE: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

Deliveries to:

Facilities Services Building

1051 11" Street

Las Vegas, NM 87701

United States Postal Service, Fedex or UPS deliveries to:

NMHU

Attn: Central Store
1005 Diamond Avenue
Las Vegas, NM 87701

INVOICING:

Terms: Net 30
Send to:

NMHU

Attn: Accounts Payable
P.O. Box 9000

Las Vegas, NM 87701

NMHU CONTACTS:

Sylvia Baca

Facilities Services Department
CFAM

Phone: 505-426-2048

Fax: 505-454-3120

Email: sbaca@nmhu.edu

Michael Saavedra

Purchasing Department

Senior Buyer

Phone: 505-454-3053

Fax: 505-454-3109

Email: mjsaavedra@nmhu.edu




NEW MEXICO HIGHLANDS UNIVERSITY
INVITATION FOR BID NUMBER: 881
DATE: DECEMBER 21, 2009

TITLE: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

SCHEDULE OF AWARDED ITEMS: Attached Sheets

THIS INVITATION FOR BID NUMBER (IFB) 881 AWARD IS MADE
SUBJECT TO ALL TERMS, CONDITIONS, AND REQUIREMENTS OF
IFB NUMBER 881 RELEASED ON SEPTEMBER 16, 20009.

NEW MEXICO HIGHLANDS UNIVERSITY

Signature: %W//

Printed Name: Michael Sé;dra
Title: Senior Buyer

Date: /o?/o?/,/ﬁ?




NEW MEXICO HIGHLANDS UNIVERSITY
INVITATION FOR BID NUMBER: 881
DATE: DECEMBER 21, 2009

TITLE: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

AWARDED ITEMS

intermediate base, tube bulb

ITEM VENDOR UNIT ARTICLE AND UNIT SHIP
DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT
BULBS AND LAMPS
001  Voss Lighting each  MHC70/U/M/4K, 70 watt, metal $16.13 12
halide bulb, medium base
002 Voss Lighting each  MHC100/U/M/4K, 100 watt, metal $15.05 12
halide bulb, medium base
003  Voss Lighting each  MHCI150/U/M/4K, 150 watt, metal $16.13 12
halide bulb, medium base
004  Voss Lighting each  MHC70/C/U/M/3K, 70 watt, coated, $16.67 12
) metal halide bulb, medium base
005  Voss Lighting each  150A/WL, 150 watt incandescent  $0.51 12
soft white bulb
006  Voss Lighting each  MH175/C/U, 175 watt bulb $10.38 12
007  Voss Lighting cach 20 watt, T3, clear, halogen capsule $1.61 10
bulb
008  Voss Lighting each  CDM35/PAR20MFL, 35 watt bulb  $29.10 12
009  Voss Lighting each  MHC50, 50 watt bulb $16.13 12
010  Voss Lighting each PL-C18W/835/4P, 18 watt, $3.35 10
compact fluorescent bulb
011  Voss Lighting cach  PL-CI15MM/28W/27, 28 watt, quad $6.04 40
tube, 2-pin, compact fluorescent lamp
012 Voss Lighting each  PL-L40W/841/4P/IS, 40 watt, T5, $4.38 25
4-pin, compact fluorescent lamp
013 Voss Lighting each  6S6-SBP, 6 watt clear bulb $0.28 48
014  Voss Lighting each  20T6-1/2/DC/IF, 20 watt, frosted,  $1.48 24
— — --DC bayonettubebulb —— -
015—Voss Lighting ————————each— 20T6-12 AR, 20-watt-T6; frosted,—$1:24—— 24 -
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INVITATION FOR BID NUMBER: 881
DATE: DECEMBER 21, 2009

TITLE: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

I'TEM VENDOR UNIT ARTICLE AND UNIT SHIP
DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT
016 Voss Lighting each MHCS50, 50 watt bulb $16.13 12
017  Voss Lighting each 90PAR38/HAL/3FL/130V, 90 watt, $7.34 12
halogen, side prong, food service PAR 38
018  Voss Lighting each  C100S54/ALTO, 100watt, high $8.88 12
pressure sodium bulb
019  Voss Lighting cach  LU400/ECO, 400 watt, high $8.88 12
pressure sodium bulb, C400S51ALTO
020  Voss Lighting each  50PAR20/HAL/NFL30, 50 watt $3.35 15
bulb
021 Voss Lighting each  F96T12/CW/SS, 60 watt, T12, $2.53 15
fluorescent lamp
022 Voss Lighting each FO96/735/ECO, 59 watt, TS, $4.97 24
fluorescent lamp
023 Voss Lighting each  LU400/ECO, 400 watt, high $8.88 12
pressure sodium bulb, C400S51ALTO
024 Voss Lighting each LU250/ECO, 250 watt, mogul $8.88 12
based, high pressure sodium bulb,
C250S50ALTO
025  Voss Lighting each LU35/MED, 35 watt, medium $8.98 12
based, pressure sodium bulb, C35576/M
026 Voss Lighting cach  LUS0/MED, 50 watt, high $8.98 12
pressure sodium bulb, C50S68/M
027  Voss Lighting cach LU150/55/ECO, 150 watt, mogul ~ $8.88 12
based, high pressure sodium bulb, C150S55ALTO
028  Voss Lighting cach  F48T12/CW/HO, 60 watt, T12, HO $2.43 15
rapid start, fluorescent lamp
029  Voss nghtmg each MP70/U/MED, 70 watt, metal $20.43 12
—_— e—hlide lamp e e e s e
030 Voss Lirgimﬂig rrrrr SR ehLGEL8DD/E/83L5—LS—W3¢$—T4—4-me 4 4-pin$335 ;HL_QL e

based, compact fluorescent bulb
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TITLE: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

ITEM VENDOR UNIT ARTICLE AND UNIT SHIP
DESCRIiPiiON PRICE AMOUNT

031 Voss Lighting each  FT36DL/841/ECO, 36 watt, TS5, $4.5 25
4-pin based, compact fluorescent bulb

032 Voss Lighting each FT40DL/841/RS, 40 watt, 2G11 $4.3 25
based, long, compact fluorescent bulb

033 Voss Lighting each 15T6, 15 watt, clear tube bulb $0.81 24

034 Voss Lighting cach  25T10/IF, 25 watt, clear tube bulb  $0.72 24

035  Voss Lighting each CF26DD/835/ECO, 26 watt, T4, $3.1 10
2-pin based, compact fluorescent bulb

036  Voss Lighting each CF9DS/827, 9 watt, 2-pin based, $1.12 10
compact fluorescent bulb

037  Voss Lighting each  CF42DT/E/IN, 42 watt, 2-pin based, $4.66 12
quad tube, bulb

038  Voss Lighting cach  CF32DT/E/835, 32 watt, triple tube, $4.66 12
compact fluorescent bulb

039  Voss Lighting each CF32DT/E/IN, 32 watt, 4-pin based, $4.66 =
triple tube, compact fluorescent bulb

040  Voss Lighting each CF13DS/835/ECO, 13 watt, 2-pin ~ $1.12 10
based, twin tube bulb

041  Voss Lighting ecach CF13DD/D841, 13 watt, 2-pin $2.58 10
based, twin tube bulb

042  Voss Lighting cach  H33GL-400/DX, 400 watt, mogul  $6.98 [§
based, mercury HID bulb

043 Voss Lighting each CF13DS/E/841, 13 watt, 4-pin $2.33 10
based, T4, single tube bulb

044 Voss Lighting each  CF26DD/E/835/ECO, 26 watt, $3.35 10
double tube, compact fluorescent bulb

045 Voss Lighting each  400/U, 400 watt, mogul based, clear, $9.60 [§

A — S ~_ metal halide lamp S -
046 Voss Lighting cach 400/U/BT28, 400 watt, mogul — §1581 12

based, clear, metal halide lamp




NEW MEXICO HIGHLANDS UNIVERSITY
INVITATION FOR BID NUMBER: 881
DATE: DECEMBER 21, 2009

TITLE: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

ITEM VENDOR UNIT ARTICLF AND UNIT SHIP
DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT
047  Voss Lighting each FT40DL/835/RS/ECO, 40 watt, T-5, $4.38 25

4-pin based, single tube, compact fluorescent bulb

048  Voss Lighting each LUIO0/MED, 100 watt, medium $8.98 12
Based, high pressure sodium bulb, C100554/M

049  Voss Lighting each F34CW/SS/ECO, 34 watt, T12, $0.69 30
rapid start fluorescent lamp
050  Voss Lighting ecach FO32/741/XP/ECO, 32 watt, T8, $1.32 25

2-pin based, fluorescent lamp

051  Voss Lighting each FO40/841/XP/eco, 40 watt, T8, $2.97 25
2-pin based, fluorescent lamp

052 Voss Lighting each  F96T12/CW/HO, 110 watt, T12 $2.45 15
recessed double contact (R17d),
VHO based fluorescent lamp

053 Voss Lighting cach  F96T12/SP41/WM/ECO, 60 watt,  $3.49 15
single pin based, fluorescent lamp

054 Voss Lighting each 75A/W/LL, 75 watt, medium based, $0.35 48

mcandescent lamp

055 No Bid each  120R/FL/MI, 120 watt, medium
based, BR40, incandescent flood lamp

056  Voss Lighting each F96T8/XL/SP35, 59 watt, single pin $4.97 24
based, fluorescent lamp
057  Voss Lighting each 150PAR/3FL/MINE, 150 watt, $7.37 12

|
|

medium side pronged based,
incandescent lamp, PAR38 lamp shape

058  Voss Lighting each  F35T12CW/U/6/WM/ECO, 35 watt, $2.98 12
medium based, bi-pin, “U” shaped,
fluorescent lamp

— 059 VossLighting. __ each LU250,250 Jwatt, mogul based,  $888 12

R : , T high pressure s sodlum HID lamp
I — _C25DSS50ALTO.

LS 4G ICAVIIL S o an w g I -
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061

062

063

064

065

066

067

068

069

070

071

Voss Lighting

Voss Lighting

Voss Lighting

Summit Electric

No bid

Voss Lighting

Voss Lighting

Voss Lighting

Voss Lighting

Voss Lighting

Voss Lighting

Voss Lighting

ITEM VENDOR UNIT ARTICLE AND UNIT SHIP
DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT
060 Voss Lighting each F32T8/SP41/U/6, 32 watt, $4.33 20

medium based, bi-pin, “U” shaped,
fluorescent lamp

each F17T8/XL/SPX41ECO, 17 watt, $1.99 25
medium based, bi-pin, fluorescent lamp

each F17T8/SP41/ECO, 17 watt. T8 $1.67 25
medium based, bi-pin, fluorescent lamp

each F20T12/CW/ECO, 17 watt, T12 $1.07 30
medium based, bi-pin, fluorescent lamp

each  F20T12/C50/ECO, 20 watt, T12 $10.81 30
medium based, bi-pin, fluorescent lamp 22119

each F25T12/SP41/ECO, 25 watt, T12
medium based, bi-pin, fluorescent lamp

each F25T8/SP41/ECO, 25 watt, T8 $1.67 25

medium bi-pin based, fluorescent lamp

each F30T12/D/RS/ECO, 30 watt, T12  $2.2 30

medium bi-pin based, fluorescent lamp

each F30T12/CW/RS, 30 watt, T12 $1.29 30
medium based, bi-pin, fluorescent lamp

each F32T8/XL/SP41/ECO, 32 watt, TS, $1.32 25
medium based, bi-pin, fluorescent lamp

each LUI50/MED, 150 watt, medium $8.98 12

based, high pressure sodium HID lamp, C50S55/M

each MVR100/U/MED, 100 watt, $15.05 12
medium based, high pressure
sodium HID lamp

each F18DBXT4/SPX27, 18 watt, T4 $3.10 10
__double tube, 2-pin baﬁsegr,jﬂuorresqenti lamp

~_each ~ MVR400/U/ED28, 400 watt,

81581 12

mogul metal halide HID lamp
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TITLE: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

ITEM VENDOR UNIT ARTICILE AND UNIT SHIP
DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT

074  Voss Lighting each  MVRI175/U, 175 watt, mogul based, $9.25 12
metal halide HID lamp

075  Voss Lighting each  40A/W, 40 watt, medium based, $0.35 48
incandescent bulb

076  Voss Lighting each FLE15HT3/2/827, 15 watt, medium $1.74 6
based, compact fluorescent bulb, EL/MDT 13W

077  Voss Lighting cach F32TBX/835/A/4, 32 watt, T4 triple $4.66 12
tube, 4-pin, compact fluorescent bulb

078  Voss Lighting cach FI13DBX23T4/SPX41, 13 watt, T4, $2.58 10
twin tube, 2-pin, compact fluorescent bulb

079  Voss Lighting each  60PAR/HIR/S/FL30, 60 watt, $6.58 12
medium skirt brass based, PAR38
shape, halogen flood lamp

080  Voss Lighting cach  90PAR/HIR/FL40/XL, 90 watt, $6.85 12
medium skirt based, PAR38 shape,
halogen flood lamp

081 Voss Lighting each F26DBX/835/ECO, 26 watt, twin  $3.10 10
tube, 2-pin, compact fluorescent bulb

082  Voss Lighting each F26TBX/827/A/4P/EOL, 26 watt,  $4.66 12
triple tube, 4-pin, compact fluorescent bulb

083  Voss Lighting each F26TBX/835/A/4P/EOL, 26 watt, $4.66 12
triple tube, 4-pin, compact fluorescent bulb

084  Voss Lighting cach F26TBX/840/A/4P/EOL, 26 watt,  $4.66 12
triple tube, 4-pin, compact fluorescent bulb

085  Voss Lighting each FLE20HT3/2/827, 20 watt, medium $1.93 6
based, single tube, compact {luorescent bulb

086  Voss Lighting ecach  MXRS50/U/MED, 50 watt, medium $16.13 12
based, metal halide HID lamp

Voss Li@iﬁg’ . ,,??‘?h, - LUTSO/MED, 150 watt, medium —  $8.98 12 e

 Dbased, metal halide HID lamp
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ITEM VENDOR UNIT ARTICLE AND UNIT SHIP
DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT

088  Voss Lighting each  F30T12/CW/RS, 30 watt, T12, $1.29 30
bi-pin, fluorescent lamp

089  Voss Lighting cach  0S6, 6 watt, candelabra based, $0.28 48
incandescent lamp

090  Voss Lighting each  MVRI150/U/MED, 150 watt, $16.13 12
metal halide HID lamp

091  Voss Lighting cach 32 watt starcoat, 2-pin, fluorescent $1.14 25
lamp

092 Voss Lighting each 50 watt, quartz lamp $1.59 10
50MR16/QIFL 36 EXN

093  Voss Lighting each 20 wall halogen lamp $3.19 10

12V/FS, 20MRII/QISP 10 ESX

BALLASTS

094  Voss Lighting each  M400/MULTI-KIT, 400 watt, $52.88 1
multi-tap magnetic ballast kit

095  Voss Lighting each  M150/MULTI-KIT, 150 watt, $66.83 1
multi-tap magnetic ballast kit

096  Voss Lighting cach  Fluorescent electromagnetic $19.29 10
ballast

097  Voss Lighting cach  HID ballast kit $55.10 1

098  Voss Lighting cach  Compact fluorescent, electronic $19.81 12
ballast

099  Voss Lighting each  HID ballast kit $49.10 1

100 Voss Lighting cach ‘Compact fluorescent, electronic  $2041 o

ballast o

10
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TITLE: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

101 Voss Lighting cach  Metal halide ballast kit $54.88 1
ITEM VENDOR UNIT ARTICiLE AND UNIT SHIP
DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT
102 Voss Lighting each  Metal halide ballast kit $66.90 1
71A5492-500D
103 Voss Lighting each  Fluorescent electronic ballast $10.10 10
VEL 4P32-SC
104 Summit Electric cach  Fluorescent electronic ballast $14.93 50
B232IUNVHP-B010C
105 Voss Lighting each  Fluorescent electronic ballast $10.10 10
10P4P32SC
106 Summit Electric each Fluorescent electronic ballast $14.93 50
B332IUNVHP-A010C
107 Voss Lighting cach  Fluorescent electronic ballast $17.70 10
REL-2P59-S-RH-TP
108  Voss Lighting cach  Metal halide ballast $52.88 1
M400MLTAI4X0001, 71A-6071-001D
109 Voss Lighting cach  Magnetic flourescent ballast $20.43 10
806SLHTCP000C, ICN2P05C35
110 Voss Lighting each  Fluorescent ballast $9.68 10
B2321UNV HP-B, ICN2P32N35
111 Voss Lighting each  Compact fluorescent electronic $20.41 12
ballast, C242UNVS E001C, ICE2542M2LDK
112 Voss Lighting cach  High pressure sodium ballast $40.55 1
12310-95-500K, 71A-7801-001D
113 Voss Lighting cach  High pressure sodium ballast $48.50 1
12310-153-500K, 71A-7971-001D
114 Summit Electric each  Magnetic compact fluorescent $8.71 25
Ballast, 4105F2P00C
P——— MQ&R‘—SV—;;::N,N B s = = _— o o = . ST e S I
115 Nebid —each ¥, HP motor —e e -

1
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INVITATION FOR BID NUMBER: 881
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TITLE: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

ITEM VENDOR UNIT ARTICLE AND UNIT SHIP
DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT

116 No bid each 1 HP motor, capacitor start,
dripproof

117 No bid each 1 HP motor, capacitor start,
dripproof

118  No bid each 1/11 HP, 4.4 inch diameter HVAC
motor

119  No bid each  1/2 HP direct drive blower motor

120 No bid each 1/3 HP motor

MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS

121 Summit Electric each  One hole strap, 203 $0.24 100

122 Summit Electric each  3/8 inch diecast connectork,40AST $0.73 100

123 Summit Electric cach 110 amp, time delay, class: RK5 $54.11 10
fuse, TRS110R

124 Summit Electric each 30 amp, time delay, class: RK5 fuse $7.64 10
TRS30R

125 Summit Electric each 2 amp, time delay, class: J, fuse $14.07 10
AJT2

126 Summit Electric cach 20 amp, time delay, class: RK1, fuse $5.41 10
A2D20R

127 Summit Electric each 15 amp, time delay, class: RK1, fuse $5.06 10
A3DI5R

128  No bid cach 10 amp, time delay, class: plug, fuse
T-10

129 Summit Electric each 15 amp, time delay, class: plug, fuse $2.5 10

SR S S = OO 55550505235 i . C}T_ lsf o iR N SR e e e e =R i
— 130 Sumnﬁt—Efec’fr'rc;%R each— 15 amp;time delay, class:G; e 58— 16
o N AG-15 - _

12
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TITLE: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

13

ITEM VENDOR UNIT ARTICLE AND UNIT SHIP
DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT
131 Summut Electric each 5 amp, time delay, fuse, TRMS5 $3.53 10
132 Summit Electric each 10 amp, time delay, fuse, TRM 10 $3.53 10
133 Summit Electric each 20 amp, fast acting, ceramic tube $1.86 10
fuse, GAB20
134 Summit Electric cach  Single gang, blank wall plate, TP131 $0.28 20
135  Summit Electric each Two gang, blank wall plate, $0.55 20
color: ivory, TP231
136 Summit Electric each  Two gang, duplex receptacle, TP821 $0.55 20
137 Summit Electric cach  Full blank, 4 inch square box, 52CI $0.27 50
138 Summit Electric each Safety switch, D223NRB $122.90 1
139 Summit Electric each  Galvanized exhaust wall shutter, $40.35 1
2C526
140 Summit Electric each 1,100 watt hand dryer, 3NXES5 $728.57 10
141 No bid each 100 watt weatherproof incandescent
Fixture, 2V067A
142 Summit Electric each  3/16 x 3 inch toggle bolts $0.21 100
143 Summit Electric each  #13 anchor kit Phillips/slotted, K14C$7.78 1
144 No bid each  Smoke detector $4.58 10
145  Summit Electric each  Fuse reducer, 1622 $9.46 10
146 Summit Electric each  Fuse reducer, 132 $28.80 10
147 No bid cach  Oven surface element
e d4&—Nebid - -~ — — ———  eaeh  Oven surface element— e e
49— Summit Eectric————eavhFine detay-fose T Y S—
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TITLE: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

ITEM VENDOR UNIT ARTICLE AND UNIT SHIP
DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT .

150  Summit Electric each Power track $65.95 10

151 Summit Electric each  Mini joiner connector $13.00 10

152 Summit Electric each  Utility box extension,5936112 $2.30 50

153 Summit Electric each  3/4 inch connector set screw (ype $0.33 25
451DC

154  Summit Electric each  One gang wall plate,SS8 $1.11 20

155 Summuit Electric each  Weatherproof one gang box,IH51LM $4.02 25

156 Summit Electric cach  Conduit body, LB body style,LB27 $12.94 10

157  Summit Electric each  Cover, hub size 1/2 in., CH190 $4.12 25

158  Summit Electric each  Conduit body,LL27 $12.94 20

159  Summit Electric each  Cover, hub size 3/4 in.,290 $4.57 100

160 Summit Electric each  Conduit body,LR27 $12.94 20

161 Summit Electric each  Conduit body, hub size 1/2 in.,LR17 $11.79 25

162 Summit Electric each  Conduit body, “T” style, T-19 $11.77 25

163 Summit Electric each  Conduit body, hub sizel 1/4 in.,LB49 $34.51 5

164  Summit Electric each  Gasket, hub sieze 1Y to 1% in., $2.22 100
GASKO045N

165  Summit Electric each  Conduit body, LB17 $10.79 10

166 Summit Electric each Isolated ground twist lock receptacle $32.46 10
IGL530R

167  Summit Electric each  Square box extension ring, $1.71 25
531511234

168 SummitElectric  cach Square box cover dupiex and foggle S316 e
S Switch,RS2 -

14
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TITLE: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

169 Summit Electric each  Handy box, 5836112 $0.97 S50
ITEM VENDOR UNIT ARTICLE AND UNIT SHIP
DESCRVIVIV’TION PRICE AMOUNT
170 Summit Electric each  One receptacle duplex box cover $7.59 10
RSL12
171 Summit Electric cach  One toggle switch box cover, RSL9 $5.28 10
172 Summit Electric each  Handy box, 5835112 $1.56 50
173 Summit Electric cach  Flat blank cover box, 72C1 $0.76 50
174 Summit Electric each  Square box cover, RS8 $1.93 50
175 Summit Electric cach  Flat blank octagon box cover, 54C6 $0.57 50
176 Summit Electric each  }2” connector set screw type, 1450  $0.28 50
177 Summit Electric each  One gang toggle switch plate, SSI ~ $1.11 20
178 Summit Electric each  Cable/cord connector, knockout $1.61 50

size 17, 1710

179 Summit Electric each 4 inch electrical box, 551511234 $4.59 50

180  Summit Electric each  1/2 inch EMT steel set screw, $0.2 S50
Connector, 1450

181  Summit Electric each  Yellow wire connector, minimum  $0.08 100

wire size: 18 gauge, maximum
wire size: 14 gauge, 30074

)
—
n
o
n
(e}

182 Summit Electric each  Wire connector, minimum $
wire size: 22 gauge, maximum
wire size: 10 gauge, 30-224]

‘.
|

183 Summit Electric each  Red wire connector, minimum $
wire size: 14 gauge, maximum
wire size: 10 gauge

=)
—_
N}
o
()

’ :
|

184  Summit Electric each  Wire connector, minimum $0.34 100
wire size: 12 gauge, maximum
e S R e E e e e WE“D’E ()ﬁgduge, 3()_454;;, P e Sy i e ]
I85 " Summit Electric ~ — — each Wire connector, 30-341 T $0.12 100 , N

15
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TITLE: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

ITEM VENDOR UNIT ARTICLE AND UNIT SHIP
- DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT
186 Summit Electric each  Blue/orange wire connector, $14.48 1
minimum wire size: 20 gauge,
maximum wire size: 14 gauge, 30-161
187  Summit Electric each  Yellow wire connector, $0.08 100
minimum wire size: 18 gauge,
maximum wire size: 14 gauge, 30-074
188  No bid each  Yellow wire connector, minimum wire
size: 18 gauge, maximum wire size: 12 gauge
189  Summit Electric each  Grounding connector, 30-092 $0.15 100
190  Summit Electric each  Photo control-type, photocell stem, $21.18 1
K4141C
191  No bid each  #8 screw, plug anchor for dry wall,
hollow brick and concrete plaster
192 No bid each  #12 screw, plug anchor for dry wall,
hollow brick and concrete plaster
193 No bid each  Wall washers wall sconces
194 Summit Electric each  Straight blade plug, PS5266X $5.78 10
195  No bid each  Single pole locking, 20 amp
196 No bid each  Incandescent lamp holder
197 Summit Electric each  Porcelain pull chain lamp holder,282 $4.19 10
198  Summit Electric each  Pull chain switch,220 $4.89 10
199 Summit Electric each  Flush mount receptacle, 3860 $2.68 10
200  Summit Electric each  Black nylon octagon box cover, L630P $16.83 10
201 Summlt Electnc each 2- polc 3 -wire, lockmg receptacle $21.45 10
2027 Summit Electric cach ~ Blank wall plate; one gang, %028 20—

color: ivory, TP13] e I
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INVITATION FOR BID NUMBER: 881
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TITLE: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

ITEM VENDOR UNI'T ARTICLE AND UNIT SHIP
DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT

203 Summit Electric cach  Blank wall plate, two gang, $0.55 20
color: ivory, TP231

204 Summit Electric cach  Wall plate, decora/toggle, TP126LA  $0.56 20

205  Summit Electric each  Toggle switch plate, 2-toggle, TP2I  $0.69 20

206 Summit Electric each  Wall plate, three gang, TP3I $0.83 15

207 Summit Electric each  Wall plate, one gang, color: satin, SS1 $1.11 20

208  Summit Electric each  Toggle wall plate with captive $0.28 F ]
Screws, TPI1T

209 Summit Electric each  Blank wall plate, 3-gang, SP331 $5.17 20

210 Summit Electric each  Outlet wall plate with captive $0.28 25
Screws, TPS8I

211 Summit Electric each  Duplex receptacle plate, 2-gang $0.55 20
TP82I

212 Summit Electric each 15 amp wall receptacle, 3232 $0.56 10

213 Summit Electric each  Single pole toggle switch, 6601G $0.73 10

214 Summit Electric each  One gang toggle switch plate, TP11 $0.28 25

215 Summit Electric 100" Liquidtite conduit, ¥ inch x 100 feet $1.05 100
12LTVA

216 Summit Electric each  Wall pack with lamp, TWH-250S-  $290.55 1
TB-LPI

217 Summit Electric each  Wrap around fixture, LB-4-32- $79.51 1
MVOLT-1/4-GEB-10IS

218 Summit Electric each 6 volt replacement battery, $22.71 1

e e e EIB-06042 - - —— —
219 —Vosstighting Wanrbnm‘non emergency tightamd—$44.83 — —F———

_exit fixture, GVEX-UBP-WHOEL90
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NEW MEXICO HIGHLANDS UNIVERSITY
INVITATION FOR BID NUMBER: 881
DATE: DECEMBER 21, 2009

TITLE: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

ITEM VENDOR UNIT ARTICL it AND UNIT SHIP
DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT

220 Voss Lighting each LED emergency exit light, $41.10 1
VEX-UBP-WH-EL90

221 Voss Lighting each Emergency light, LL90 $16.95 1

222 Summit Electric each  Wall pack fixture $75.28 1
TWS-26/42-TRT-MVOLT-L/LP

223 Summit Electric each  Replacement diffuser, DL.B24 $22.36 1

224 Summit Electric each  Low profile wrap around fluorescent $48.93 i
fixture, LB-2-20-120

225 Summit Electric each  Low profile wrap around fluorescent $91.29 1
fixture, LB-4-20-120

226 Summit Electric each  Low profile wrap around fluorescent $60.65 1
fixture, SB-217-120-ADDE

227 Summit Electric each  Cartridge fuse, TR15R $3.44 10

228  No bid each  DCI liquid tight connector

229 * No bid each  DCI liquid tight connector

230  Summit Electric each  1/2 inch compression connector $0.51 35
660DC

231 Summit Electric cach  1/2 inch angle connector, 736DC $0.88 15

232 Summit Electric each  3/4 inch angle connector, 738DC $0.90 10

233 Summit Electric each 90 degree angle connector,724DC  $0.53 1

234 Summit Electric each 1 1/4 inch one hole EMT strap, 4966 $.07 100

235 Summit Electric each  3/4 inch cast squeeze type connector $0.62 25
709DC

S 236 Summit Electric each - 1/2.inch angle connector, 708DC- - $0.52 7 éﬁ jf%¥
237  Summit Electric each  1.inch EMT connector compression $1.17 25
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TITLE: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

Type. 1652DC

ITEM VENDOR UNIT ARTICLE AND UNIT SHIP
DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT

238 Summit Electric each  3/4 inch EMT connector $0.75 25
compression type, 1651DC

239 Summit Electric each 1 inch EMT connector set screw type $1.22 15
1452DC

240 Summit Electric each EMT compression type concrete $2.07 12
Tight, 1653DC

241 Summit Electric each  Surface-mounted radiant heater,9297T $62.00 1

242 Summit Electric each  Single pole switch, CS20AC1-1 $2.5 10

243 Voss Lighting each 6 volt, lead acid battery, $4.99 10
IST SLA 0905

244 Summit Electric each  EMT coupling, suppression type, 661DC  $0.65 25

245 Summit Electric each 1 inch EMT coupling, compression $1.05 25
Type, 662DC

246 Summit Electric each 1 1/4 inch EMT coupling, $1.89 10
suppression type, 663DC

247  No bid each  Liquid tight 90 degree connector

248 Summit Electric each  1/2 inch flex connector,736DC $0.88 15

249  Summit Electric each  One hole 1 inch EMT strap, 202 $0.19 100

250  No bid cach  1/2 inch liquid tight connector

251 Summit Electric each 1 inch EMT connector set screw $0.64 15
type, 452DC

252 Summit Electric each 1 inch EMT connector set screw $0.64 20
type, 462DC

253 Summit Electric each  1/2 inch EMT connector, set screw  $0.22 35
type, 260DC

254—No bid ——vcach— 3/4 inchtiquidtightconnector - —————————

255 Summit Electric each  Lampholder, L-80 %279 36
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TITLE: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

ITEM VENDOR UNIT ARTICLE AND UNIT SHIP
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256 Summit Electric each  Black plastic electric tape, MM 33 $4.04 10
257  Summit Electric each  3/8 inch liquid tight flex connector  $2.53 ]
5231
258  Summit Electric ecach  Cable connector, knockout size 1/2  $0.55 100

‘.
|

Inch, NC501SC

259  No bid each  Two pole, 30 amp breaker

260  No bid each  One pole, 20 amp breaker

261 Summit Electric each 4 inch square cover, RS-8 $1.98 50

262 Summit Electric cach  Single gang box plaster ring,52-C-36 $4.87 50

263  Summit Electric each 4 inch square cover, 52-C-1 $0.27 50

264  Summit Electric each 4 inch square cover, 52-C-13 $0.40 50

265  Summit Electric each  Utility outlet box cover, 58-C-7 $0.43 50 or 25

266 Summit Electric each  Utility outlet box cover, 58-C-1 $0.40 5

267  Summit Electric each  Utility outlet box cover, 58-C-6 $0.52 25

268  Summit Electric each  One toggle switch outlet box cover $0.43 25
58-C-30

269  Summit Electric each  One hole strap, conduit size: 3/4 inch $0.11 100
CH 201

270  Summit Electric each  Conduit strap, size: 3/8 inch, TW38 $0.08 100

271 Summit Electric each 4 inch one toggle switch, RS9 $1.02 50

272 Summit Electric cach  Metal halide ballast, M175ML-5AC3M $53.97 10

273720}7:1(1_ - __cach ~ Thermostat guard e

274 Nobid - *EEEF';EFCCTricrhicatﬂ)er*ﬁd_@a’tﬁ” T E——
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DATE: DECEMBER 21, 2009
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275 Summit Electric cach  Raceway elbow, V517 S1.78 10
ITEM VENDOR UNIT ARTICLE AND UNIT SHIP
' DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT

276  Summit Electric each Metal raceway, V500 $9.90 10

277  Summit Electric each  Surface raceway supporting clip $0.39 100
V5703

278  Summit Electric . each  Flush type extension adapter, V5751 $05.53 10

279  Summit Electric each  Switch and receptacle box, V5748  $6.19 3

280  Summit Electric each Raceway 90 degree elbow, $1.42 10
color: ivory, V511

281  Summit Electric each Raceway strap, color: ivory, V504  $0.26 100

282  Summit Electric ecach Internal elbow, color: ivory, V517 $1.78 10

283  Nobid each  1/2 inch male connector

284  Summit Electric each Internal 90 degree twisted elbow $3.77 10
V5711LHA

285  Summit Electric each  Switch and receptacle box $6.19 10
V5748

286  Summit Electric each Internal elbow fitting $3.77 10
V5711RHA

287  Summit Electric each  Shallow raceway box, V5747 $5.11 10




